Title 15
BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION

Chapters:
15.04 City Building Code

15.06 Moving of Buildings

15.07  Building Demoalition

15.08 Recodified

15.10 Drainage

1511 Flood Hazard Reduction

15.12 Installation of Underground Utilities— Electrical Construction
15.13 Violation — Penalty

15-1 (Revised 7/10)






Clyde Hill Municipal Code

Chapter 15.04
CITY BUILDING CODE

Sections:

15.04.010 Purpose.

15.04.020 State building code adopted.

15.04.030 Copies of codes available for
public inspection.

15.04.040 Code conflicts.

15.04.050 Amendments to the International
Building Code (1BC).

15.04.060 Amendments to the International
Residential Code (IRC).

15.04.070 Amendments to the International
Fire Code (IFC).

15.04.080 Processing of permits.

15.04.090 Landscape site and/or plan review.

15.04.100 Reflective roofing prohibited —
Exceptions.

15.04.200 Violation — Penalty.

15.04.010 Purpose.

The purpose of this chapter isto promote the
health, safety and welfare of the public as a
whole by ensuring that buildings, dwellings,
structures and land will be constructed, main-
tained and used in a manner so as to reduce
hazards, increase durability and require con-
sistent patterns of community development;
provided, that any duties established in this
chapter or the codes adopted in this chapter are
duties owed to the public asawhol e, not to any
individual, persons or class of persons. (Ord.
908 § 1 (Exh. A), 2010)

15.04.020 State building code adopted.

The following codes, together with the spe-
cifically identified appendices and the amend-
ments in the Washington Administrative Code
(WAC), and as further amended in this title,
are hereby adopted by reference:

A. International Building Code, 2009 Edi-
tion, including Appendix J, with statewide
amendments at Chapter 51-50 WAC;

B. International Residential Code, 2009
Edition, including Appendix C, Exit Terminals
of Mechanica Draft and Direct-Venting Sys-

15-3

15.04.030

tems,; Appendix H, Patio Covers, and Appen-
dix R, Dwelling Unit Fire Sprinkler Systems,
with statewide amendments at Chapter 51-51
WAC;

C. International Mechanical Code, 2009
Edition, with statewide amendments at Chap-
ter 51-52 WAC;

D. International Fire Code, 2009 Edition,
including Appendix B, Fire Flow Require-
ments for Buildings, and Appendix C, Fire
Hydrant Locations and Distribution, with
statewide amendments at Chapter 52-54
WAC;

E. ICC/ANSI A117.1-03, Accessible and
Usable Buildings and Facilities, with state-
wide amendments at Chapter 51-50 WAC;

F. Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code, 2009
Edition (NFPA 58);

G. Nationa Fuel Gas Code (NFPA 54) for
LP Gas, asamended pursuant to Chapter 51-52
WAC,

H. Uniform Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition,
with statewide amendments at Chapters 51-56
and 51-57 WAC;

|. The Washington State Energy Code, as
published by the Washington State Building
Code Council, pursuant to Chapter 51-11
WAC;

J. International Existing Buildings Code,
2009 Edition, with statewide amendments at
Chapter 51-50 WAC;

K. National Electrical Code (NFPA 70);
and

L. 1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement
of Dangerous Buildings as published by
ICBO. (Ord. 908 § 1 (Exh. A), 2010)

15.04.030 Copiesof codesavailable for
public inspection.

The codes, appendices and standards set
forth in this chapter shall be filed with the city
clerk and a copy made available for use and
examination by the public pursuant to RCW
35A.12.140. (Ord. 908 § 1 (Exh. A), 2010)

(Revised 7/10)



15.04.040

15.04.040 Code conflicts.

In cases of conflict among the codes enu-
merated in CHMC 15.04.020(A), (B), (C), and
(D), the first named code shall govern over
those following. (Ord. 908 § 1 (Exh. A), 2010)

15.04.050 Amendmentsto International
Building Code (1BC).

All requirements of the IBC shall be fol-
lowed unless otherwise amended in this sec-
tion.

A. Section 105.1 IBC Amended (Storm
Drainage Required). Section 105.1 of the
International  Building Code is hereby
amended by adding the following:

Except as specified within this code,
no building or structure shall be erect-
ed, constructed, enlarged, altered, re-
paired, moved, improved, removed,
converted or demolished unless a sep-
arate permit for each building or struc-
ture has first been obtained from the
building official. All storm drainage
systems (both on-site and off-site)
shall be encompassed within the build-
ing permit and designed according to
the requirements of the Clyde Hill Mu-
nicipal Code.

B. Section 105.2 IBC Amended (Work
Exempt from Permit). Section 105.2 of the
International  Building Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Exemptions from permit requirements
of this code shall not be deemed to
grant authorization for any work to be
done in any manner in violation of the
provisions of this code or any other
laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.
Permits shall not be required for the
following:

Building:
1. One-story detached accessory

structures used as tool and storage
sheds, playhouses and similar uses,

(Revised 7/10)

154

provided the floor area does not ex-
ceed 120 square feet and meets the
accessory structure regulations of the
Clyde Hill Municipal Code.

2. Fences not over 6 feet high. This
exemption shall not apply to structures
designed or used for sound attenua-
tion purposes.

3. Retaining walls that are not over 4
feet in height measured from the bot-
tom of the footing to the top of the wall,
unless supporting a surcharge or im-
pounding Class |, Il or llIA liquids.

4. Sidewalks and driveways not more
than 30 inches above adjacent grade,
and not over any basement or story
below and are not part of an accessible
route.

5. Temporary motion picture, televi-
sion and theater stage sets and scen-
ery limited to thirty (30) days.

6. Swings and other playground
equipment accessory to single family
dwellings, not affecting the structural
coverage allowance of the lot and
meets the accessory structure regula-
tions of the Clyde Hill Municipal Code.

7. Painting, papering, tiling, cabinets,
counter tops, carpeting and other sim-
ilar finish work for which inspection to
verify code compliance is not required
unless these items are part of a larger
project that requires a building permit.

8. Pre-fabricated swimming pools lo-
cated above grade that contain water
not over 24 inches in depth.

9. Non-fixed and moveable cases,
racks, counters and partitions not over
five feet, nine inches (5'9") in height,
unless these items are part of a larger
project that requires a building permit.



Clyde Hill Municipal Code 15.04.050

C. Section 105.5 IBC Amended (Expira-
tion and Permit Renewal). Section 105.5 of the
International  Building Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

permit. The fee shall not be less than
25% of the initial building permit fee.
Permits that have expired will be sub-
ject to compliance with any new or re-

1. Every permitissued by the city shall
expire and become invalid one year
from the date of issuance. A permit
must be renewed for any work to con-
tinue beyond the permit's term. No
work shall be allowed without a valid
permit. Renewal of permits shall be as
follows:

a. One year from the date of building
permit issuance the exterior of the
building or structure shall be complete-
ly finished according to the permit doc-
uments. The site shall have stabilized
erosion control, be cleaned of debris,
materials and equipment and other
construction associated items. Should
the exterior of the building or structure
and the site not be completed as re-
quired at the end of the one-year build-
ing permit term, the permit shall be re-
newed by the applicant at a fee that is
twice the full original permit fee.

b. To renew a building permit that has

vised state and local requirements that
are valid at the time of renewal, includ-
ing any fee changes.

2. Every permit issued shall become
invalid unless the work on the site au-
thorized by such permit is commenced
within 180 days after its issuance, or if
the work authorized on the site by such
permit is suspended or abandoned for
a period of 180 days after the time the
work is commenced. The building offi-
cial is authorized to grant, in writing,
one or more extensions of time, for pe-
riods not more than 180 days each.
The extension shall be requested in
writing and justifiable cause demon-
strated.

3. To renew a city-issued permit other
than a building permit (e.g. mechani-
cal, drainage), a new application shall
be made subject to compliance with
any new or revised state and local re-
guirements that are valid at the time of
renewal, including any fee changes.

D. Section107.1.11BC New (Pre-Applica
tion Conference). Section 107.1.1 of the Inter-
national Building Codeishereby added to read
asfollows:

not yet expired but the exterior of the
building and site is completed as re-
quired, the applicant shall obtain a new
building permit and pay a permit fee

based upon the building official's de-
termination of the remaining work yet
to be performed under the initial build-
ing permit. The fee shall not be less
than 25% of the initial building permit
fee.

c. To renew a building permit that has
expired and the exterior of the building
and site is completed as required, the
applicant shall obtain a new building
permit and pay a permit fee based
upon the building official’'s determina-
tion of the remaining work yet to be
performed under the initial building

15-5

A pre-application conference, as de-
fined in Section 19.02.001 CHMC,
may be requested by a property owner
or their agent for any potential project
to help facilitate the review process
through discussion and clarification of
the code requirements and information
or documentation required for a com-
plete application. A fee for this confer-
ence will be set by council resolution
and established to provide an incen-
tive for a pre-application meeting.

(Revised 7/10)



15.04.050

E. Section 107.2.1 IBC Amended (Submit-
tal Documents). Section 107.2.1 of the Interna-
tional Building Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

any of the provisions of this Code. The
value to be used in computing the
building permit and building plan re-
view fees shall be the total estimated

Information on construction docu-
ments.

Construction documents shall be
drawn upon architectural standard. All
documents shall be assembled in
proper order and stapled together ap-
propriately. Plans and drawings shall
be no larger than 48" wide and 36" tall
unless otherwise allowed by the build-
ing official. Electronic media docu-
ments are permitted to be submitted
when approved by the building official.

Construction documents shall be of
sufficient clarity to indicate the loca-
tion, nature and extent of the work pro-
posed and show in detail that the pro-
posed project will conform to the
provisions of this code and relevant
laws, ordinances, rules and regula-
tions, as determined by the building of-
ficial. Where required by the building
official, all braced wall lines, shall be
identified on the construction docu-

current value of all labor, materials,
contractor's overhead and profit,
whether paid for or not, for the con-
struction work for which the permit is
issued, as well as all finish work, paint-
ing, roofing, electrical, plumbing, heat-
ing, air conditioning, elevators, fire ex-
tinguishing systems, on-site storm
drainage systems and improvements
and any other permanent equipment.

For the purposes of obtaining a plan
review and setting the initial review
fee, the applicant shall provide an esti-
mate of the project’s valuation on their
application. If in the opinion of the
building official the estimated valuation
is not accurate, the building official
shall adjust the valuation and any re-
view fee difference shall be paid by or
to the applicant prior to issuance of the
permit. A project’s final valuation shall
be set by the building official, who shall
develop, keep current and base their
computations on a Current Valuation
Table.

G. Section 109.4 IBC Amended (Work
Commencing before Permit | ssuance). Section
109.4 of the International Building Code is
hereby amended as follows:

ments and all pertinent information in-
cluding, but not limited to, bracing
methods, location and length of braced
wall panels, foundation requirements
of braced wall panels, foundation re-
qguirements of braced wall panels at
top and bottom shall be provided.

F. Section 109.3 IBC Amended (Building
Permit Valuation). Section 109.3 of the Inter-
national Building Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

Any person who commences work re-
quiring a permit on a building, struc-
ture, electrical, gas or plumbing sys-
tem before obtaining the necessary
permits shall be subject to a special in-
vestigation and administration fee
equal to the amount of the building per-

The city council shall set plan review mit fee required by this code. This fee

fees, permit fees and costs for inspec-
tions or additional plan review by reso-
lution.

The Building Official shall make the de-
termination of value or valuation under

(Revised 7/10)

15-6

is in addition to all other fees that may
apply to the project and is required to
be paid before the issuance of any per-
mit. The investigation fee shall be col-
lected whether or not a permit is then
or subsequently issued. The payment



Clyde Hill Municipal Code

of an investigative fee shall not exempt
any person from compliance with all
other provisions of this code nor from
any penalty prescribed by law.

H. Section 109.7 IBC Added (Consultant
Fees). Section 109.7 of the International
Building Code is hereby added asfollows:

The building official may require the re-
tention of professional consulting ser-
vices during permit review or inspec-
tion of any portion of a building,
mechanical or storm drainage permit.
Whenever review of a building permit
application requires retention by the
city for professional consulting servic-
es, the applicant shall reimburse the
city the cost of such professional con-
sulting services. This fee shall be in

15.04.050

In addition to regular code-specified in-
spections, special inspections and
structural observations, the building of-
ficial may require visual observation
and testing of structural systems, me-
chanical systems, plumbing systems
and energy systems to confirm compli-
ance with approved construction docu-
ments. These inspection requirements
apply to all projects with 4,000 square
feet or greater of additional floor area,
or as the building official may find nec-
essary. When required, visual obser-
vations and testing are to be per-
formed or overseen by a registered
design professional approved by the
building official. All costs for inspec-
tions are the responsibility of the per-
mit holder.

J. Section 110.3.10 IBC Amended (Final
Inspection). Section 110.3.10 of the Interna-
tional Building Codeis hereby amended asfol-
lows:

addition to the normal plan review and
building permit fees. The building offi-
cial may require the applicant to de-
posit a cash bond with the city of a suf-

ficient amount to cover anticipated
costs to retaining professional consult-
ant services and ensure reimburse-
ment for such costs. The deposit
amount will be determined by the
building official. Any interest earned by
the cash bond shall be retained by the
City to reimburse for costs associated

The final inspection shall be made af-
ter all work required by the building
permit is completed. If more than 60
days has elapsed since the expiration
of the permit, an additional inspection
fee, as established by resolution of the
city council, shall be charged.

with establishing and administering the
cash bond.
|. Section 110.3.8 IBC Amended (Other
Inspections). Section 110.3.8 of the Interna-
tional Building Codeis hereby amended asfol-
lows:

K. Section 110.7 IBC Added (Re-Inspec-
tion and Fees). Section 110.7 of the Interna-
tional Building Code is hereby added as
follows:

In addition to inspections as required
by this code including regular inspec-
tions by the building official, special in-
spections and structural observations,
the building official is authorized to
make or require other inspections of
any construction work to ascertain
compliance with the provisions of this
code and other laws that are enforced
by the city.

15-7

The building official may require a
structure or portions of work to be re-
inspected. A re-inspection fee may be
assessed for each inspection or re-in-
spection when such portion of work for
which the inspection was requested is
not complete; or when previous cor-
rections called for are not made; or
when duplicate inspections for the
same work are requested which result
in additional time or resources expend-
ed; or when the approved plans and
permit are not on site in a conspicuous

(Revised 7/10)



15.04.050

or pre-approved location; or when the
building is not accessible. In instances
where re-inspection fees have been
assessed, no additional inspection of
the work shall be provided by the city
until the required fees are paid. The
city council shall set re-inspection fees
by resolution.

A cash bond shall be required in the
amount of one-half (1/2) of the permit
fee, or $10,000, whichever amount is
the lesser, to guarantee completion of
any required work. Any interest in-
come from this bond shall be retained
by the City to reimburse for costs asso-
ciated with establishing and adminis-

L. Section 111.2.1 IBC Added (All Work
Completed — Fees Paid). Section 111.2.1 of the
International Building Codeis hereby added as
follows:

tering the cash bond. Administration

fees for costs incurred by the city to

process a temporary certificate of oc-
cupancy will be assessed.

N. Section 113 IBC Amended (Board of
Appeals). Section 113 of the International
Building Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

When a series of related permits such
as grading, drainage, fire sprinkler,

swimming pool, fencing or other ac-
cessory buildings are issued in con-
junction with a building permit for the
renovation, reconstruction or new con-
struction of a residence, the certificate
of occupancy for the residence shall
not be issued until all regulated work
under all related permits has been
completed, inspected and approved
and all fees or charges have been
paid.

113.1 General. Appeals of orders, de-
cisions or determinations made by the
building official relative to the applica-
tion and interpretation of the provisions
of this Code shall be directed to the
Board of Adjustment of the City of
Clyde Hill, and the decisions of such
Board shall be final in all respects. De-
cisions and findings of said Board in

M. Section 111.3 IBC Amended (Tempo-
rary Certificate of Occupancy). Section 111.3
of the International Building Code is hereby
amended as follows:

respect to matters pertaining to this
Code shall be in writing, with copies to
the Building Official and the appellant.
The Building Official shall attend all

The building official is authorized, but
is not required to issue a temporary
certificate of occupancy before com-
pletion of the entire work covered by
the permits issued, provided that such
portion or portions shall be occupied
safely. A temporary certificate of occu-
pancy may only be issued in associa-
tion with a valid building permit. The
building official is authorized to make
any or all safety or accessibility re-
quirements a condition of the tempo-
rary occupancy. The building official
shall set a time period during which the
temporary occupancy is valid but shall
not exceed ninety (90) days from the
date of issuance.

(Revised 7/10)

15-8

meetings of said Board at which ap-
peals under this section are scheduled
for hearing. The Board of Adjustment
shall adopt reasonable rules and regu-
lations for conducting its investigations
and processing of appeals under this
section.

113.2 Limitations on Authority. Appli-
cations for appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of this code or
the rules legally adopted thereunder
have been incorrectly interpreted, the
provisions of this code do not fully ap-
ply or an equally good or better form of
construction is proposed. The Board of
Adjustment shall have no authority rel-
ative to interpretation of the adminis-
trative provisions of this code nor shall
the board be empowered to waive re-



Clyde Hill Municipal Code

quirements of either this code or the
technical codes which are the codes,
appendices and referenced code stan-
dards adopted by the city.

(Ord. 908 § 1 (Exh. A), 2010)

15.04.060 Amendmentsto International
Residential Code (IRC).

All requirements of the IRC shall be fol-
lowed unless otherwise amended in this sec-
tion.

A. Section R105.1.1 IRC New (Storm
Drainage Required). Section R105.1.1 of the
International Residential Codeis hereby added
to read asfollows:

Except as specified within this code,
no building or structure shall be erect-
ed, constructed, enlarged, altered, re-
paired, moved, improved, removed,
converted or demolished unless a sep-
arate permit for each building or struc-
ture has first been obtained from the
building official. All storm drainage
systems (both on-site and off-site)
shall be encompassed within the build-
ing permit and designed according to
the requirements of the Clyde Hill Mu-
nicipal Code.

B. Section R105.2 IRC Amended (Work
Exempt from Permit). Section R105.2 of the
International Residential Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Exemptions from permit requirements
of this code shall not be deemed to
grant authorization for any work to be
done in any manner in violation of the
provisions of this code or any other
laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.
Permits shall not be required for the
following:

Building:

1. One-story detached accessory
structures used as tool and storage
sheds, playhouses and similar uses,
provided the floor area does not ex-

15-8.1

15.04.060

ceed 120 square feet and meets the
accessory structure regulations of the
Clyde Hill Municipal Code.

2. Fences not over 6 feet high. This
exemption shall not apply to structures
designed or used for sound attenua-
tion purposes.

3. Retaining walls that are not over 4
feet in height measured from the bot-
tom of the footing to the top of the wall,
unless supporting a surcharge or im-
pounding Class I, Il or IlIA liquids.

4. Sidewalks and driveways not more
than 30 inches above adjacent grade,
and not over any basement or story
below and are not part of an accessible
route.

5. Temporary motion picture, televi-
sion and theater stage sets and scen-
ery limited to thirty (30) days.

6. Swings and other playground
equipment accessory to single family
dwellings, not affecting the structural
coverage allowance of the lot and
meets the accessory structure regula-
tions of the Clyde Hill Municipal Code.

7. Painting, papering, tiling, cabinets,
counter tops, carpeting and other sim-
ilar finish work for which inspection to
verify code compliance is not required
unless these items are part of a larger
project that requires a building permit.

8. Pre-fabricated swimming pools lo-
cated above grade that contain water
not over 24 inches in depth.

9. Non-fixed and moveable cases,
racks, counters and partitions not over
five feet, nine inches (5'9") in height,
unless these items are part of a larger
project that requires a building permit.

(Revised 7/10)



15.04.060

C. Section R105.5 IRC Amended (Expira-
tion and Permit Renewal). Section R105.5 of
the International Residential Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

permit. The fee shall not be less than
25% of the initial building permit fee.
Permits that have expired will be sub-
ject to compliance with any new or re-

1. Every permitissued by the city shall
expire and become invalid one year
from the date of issuance. A permit
must be renewed for any work to con-
tinue beyond the permit's term. No
work shall be allowed without a valid
permit. Renewal of permits shall be as
follows:

a. One year from the date of building
permit issuance the exterior of the
building or structure shall be complete-
ly finished according to the permit doc-
uments. The site shall have stabilized
erosion control, be cleaned of debris,
materials and equipment and other
construction associated items. Should
the exterior of the building or structure
and the site not be completed as re-
guired at the end of the one-year build-
ing permit term, the permit shall be re-
newed by the applicant at a fee that is
twice the full original permit fee.

b. To renew a building permit that has

vised state and local requirements that
are valid at the time of renewal, includ-
ing any fee changes.

2. Every permit issued shall become
invalid unless the work on the site au-
thorized by such permit is commenced
within 180 days after its issuance, or if
the work authorized on the site by such
permit is suspended or abandoned for
a period of 180 days after the time the
work is commenced. The building offi-
cial is authorized to grant, in writing,
one or more extensions of time, for pe-
riods not more than 180 days each.
The extension shall be requested in
writing and justifiable cause demon-
strated.

3. To renew a city-issued permit other
than a building permit (e.g. mechani-
cal, drainage), a new application shall
be made subject to compliance with
any new or revised state and local re-
guirements that are valid at the time of
renewal, including any fee changes.

D. Section R106.1.1 IRC Amended (Sub-
mittal Documents). Section R106.1.1 of the
International Residential Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

not yet expired but the exterior of the
building and site is completed as re-
quired, the applicant shall obtain a new
building permit and pay a permit fee

based upon the building official’'s de-
termination of the remaining work yet
to be performed under the initial build-
ing permit. The fee shall not be less
than 25% of the initial building permit
fee.

c. To renew a building permit that has
expired and the exterior of the building
and site is completed as required, the
applicant shall obtain a new building
permit and pay a permit fee based
upon the building official’'s determina-
tion of the remaining work yet to be
performed under the initial building

(Revised 7/10)

15-8.2

Information on construction docu-
ments.

Construction documents shall be
drawn upon architectural standard. All
documents shall be assembled in
proper order and stapled together ap-
propriately. Plans and drawings shall
be no larger than 48" wide and 36" tall
unless otherwise allowed by the build-
ing official. Electronic media docu-
ments are permitted to be submitted
when approved by the building official.



Clyde Hill Municipal Code

Construction documents shall be of
sufficient clarity to indicate the loca-
tion, nature and extent of the work pro-
posed and show in detail that the pro-
posed project will conform to the
provisions of this code and relevant
laws, ordinances, rules and regula-
tions, as determined by the building of-
ficial. Where required by the building
official, all braced wall lines, shall be
identified on the construction docu-
ments and all pertinent information in-
cluding, but not limited to, bracing
methods, location and length of braced
wall panels, foundation requirements
of braced wall panels, foundation re-
qguirements of braced wall panels at
top and bottom shall be provided.

15.04.060

ficial. The value to be used in comput-
ing the building permit and building
plan review fees shall be the total esti-
mated current value of all labor, mate-
rials, contractor’s overhead and profit,
whether paid for or not, for the con-
struction work for which the permit is
issued, as well as all finish work, paint-
ing, roofing, electrical, plumbing, heat-
ing, air conditioning, elevators, fire ex-
tinguishing systems, on-site storm
drainage systems and improvements
and any other permanent equipment.

For the purposes of obtaining a plan
review and setting the initial review
fee, the applicant shall provide an esti-
mate of the project’s valuation on their

E. Section R106.1.1.1 IRC New (Pre-
Application Conference). Section R106.1.1.1
of the International Residential Code is hereby
added to read as follows:

application. If in the opinion of the
building official the estimated valuation
is not accurate, the building official
shall adjust the valuation and any re-
view fee difference shall be paid by or
to the applicant prior to issuance of the
permit. A project’s final valuation shall
be set by the building official, who shall
develop, keep current and base their
computations on a Current Valuation
Table.

G. Section R108.6 IRC Amended (Work
Commencing before Permit | ssuance). Section
R108.6 of the International Residential Codeis
hereby amended as follows:

A pre-application conference, as de-
fined in Section 19.02.001 CHMC,
may be requested by a property owner
or their agent for any potential project
to help facilitate the review process
through discussion and clarification of
the associated code requirements and
the information or documentation re-
quired for a complete application. A fee
for this conference will be set by coun-
cil resolution and established to pro-
vide an incentive for a pre-application
meeting.

F. Section R108.3 IRC Amended (Building
Permit Valuation). Section R108.3 of the
International Residential Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Any person who commences work re-
quiring a permit on a building, struc-
ture, electrical, gas or plumbing sys-
tem before obtaining the necessary
permits shall be subject to a special in-
vestigation and administration fee
equal to the amount of the building per-
mit fee required by this code. This fee
is in addition to all other fees that may
apply to the project and is required to
be paid before the issuance of any per-
mit. The investigation fee shall be col-
lected whether or not a permit is then
or subsequently issued. The payment
of an investigative fee shall not exempt

The city council shall set plan review
fees, permit fees and costs for inspec-
tions or additional plan review by reso-
lution.

The determination of value or valua-
tion under any of the provisions of this
Code shall be made by the Building Of-

15-8.3 (Revised 7/10)



15.04.060

any person from compliance with all
other provisions of this code nor from
any penalty prescribed by law.

H. Section R108.7 IRC Added (Consultant

The building official may require the re-
tention of professional consulting ser-
vices during permit review or inspec-
tion of any portion of a building,
mechanical or storm drainage permit.
Whenever review of a building permit
application requires retention by the
city for professional consulting servic-
es, the applicant shall reimburse the

Fees). Section R108.7 of the International Res-
idential Code is hereby added as follows:

tions; structural systems, mechanical
systems, plumbing systems, and ener-
gy systems may be required to have vi-
sual observation and testing to confirm
compliance with approved construc-
tion documents. These inspection re-
qguirements apply to all projects with
4,000 square feet or greater of addi-
tional floor area, or as the building offi-
cial may find necessary. When re-
quired, visual observations and testing
are to be performed or overseen by a
registered design professional ap-
proved by the building official. All costs
for inspections are the responsibility of
the permit holder.

J. Section R109.1.6 IRC Amended (Find
Inspection). Section R109.1.6 of the Interna-
tional Residential Code is hereby amended as
follows:

city the cost of such professional con-
sulting services. This fee shall be in
addition to the normal plan review and
building permit fees. The building offi-

cial may require the applicant to de-
posit a cash bond with the city of a suf-
ficient amount to cover anticipated
costs to retaining professional consult-
ant services and ensure reimburse-
ment for such costs. The deposit
amount will be determined by the
building official. Any interest earned by

The final inspection shall be made af-
ter all work required by the building
permit is completed. If more than 30
days has elapsed since the expiration
of the permit, an additional inspection
fee, as established by resolution of the
city council, shall be charged.

the cash bond will be used as a fee by
the city to set up and administration.

I. Section R109.1.5 IRC Amended (Other
Inspections). Section R109.1.5 of the Interna-
tional Residential Code is hereby amended as
follows:

K. Section R119.1.7 IRC Added (Re-
Inspection and Fees). Section R109.1.7 of the
International Residential Codeis hereby added
asfollows:

In addition to inspections as required
by this code including regular inspec-
tions by the building official, special in-
spections and structural observations;
the building official is authorized to
make or require other inspections of
any construction work to ascertain
compliance with the provisions of this
code and other laws that are enforced
by the City of Clyde Hill.

In addition to regular code specified
City of Clyde Hill inspections, special
inspections and structural observa-

(Revised 7/10)

15-8.4

The building official may require a
structure or portions of work to be re-
inspected. A re-inspection fee may be
assessed for each inspection or re-in-
spection when such portion of work for
which the inspection was requested is
not complete; or when previous cor-
rections called for are not made; or
when duplicate inspections for the
same work are requested which result
in additional time or resources expend-
ed; or when the approved plans and
permit are not on site in a conspicuous
or pre-approved location; or when the
building is not accessible. In instances
where re-inspection fees have been



Clyde Hill Municipal Code

assessed, no additional inspection of
the work shall be provided by the city
until the required fees are paid. The
city council shall set re-inspection fees
by resolution.

15.04.060

the lesser, to guarantee completion of
any required work. Any interest in-
come from this bond shall be retained
by the City to reimburse for costs asso-
ciated with establishing and adminis-

L. Section R110.1.1 IRC Added (All Work
Completed — Fees Paid). Section R110.1.1 of
the International Residential Code is hereby
added asfollows:

tering the cash bond. Administration
fees for costs incurred by the city to
process a temporary certificate of oc-
cupancy will be assessed.

N. Section R112 IRC Amended (Board of
Appeals). Section R112 of the International
Residential Codeis hereby amended to read as
follows:

When a series of related permits such
as grading, drainage, fire sprinkler,

swimming pool, fencing or other ac-
cessory buildings are issued in con-
junction with a building permit for the
renovation, reconstruction or new con-
struction of a residence, the certificate
of occupancy for the residence shall
not be issued until all regulated work
under all related permits has been
completed, inspected and approved
and all fees or charges have been
paid.

112.1 General. Appeals of orders, de-
cisions or determinations made by the
building official relative to the applica-
tion and interpretation of the provisions
of this Code shall be directed to the
Board of Adjustment of the City of
Clyde Hill, and the decisions of such
Board shall be final in all respects. De-
cisions and findings of said Board in

M. Section R110.4 IRC Amended (Tempo-
rary Certificate of Occupancy). Section
R110.4 of the International Residential Codeis
hereby amended as follows:

respect to matters pertaining to this
Code shall be in writing, with copies to
the Building Official and the appellant.
The Building Official shall attend all

The building official is authorized, but
is not required to issue a temporary
certificate of occupancy before com-
pletion of the entire work covered by
the permits issued, provided that such
portion or portions shall be occupied
safely. A temporary certificate of occu-
pancy may only be issued in associa-
tion with a valid building permit. The
building official is authorized to make
any or all safety or accessibility re-
guirements a condition of the tempo-
rary occupancy. The building official
shall set a time period during which the
temporary occupancy is valid but shall
not exceed ninety (90) days from the
date of issuance.

A cash bond shall be required in the
amount of one-half (1/2) of the permit
fee, or $10,000, whichever amount is

15-85

meetings of said Board at which ap-
peals under this section are scheduled
for hearing. The Board of Adjustment
shall adopt reasonable rules and regu-
lations for conducting its investigations
and processing of appeals under this
section.

112.2 Limitations on Authority. Appli-
cations for appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of this code or
the rules legally adopted thereunder
have been incorrectly interpreted, the
provisions of this code do not fully ap-
ply or an equally good or better form of
construction is proposed. The board of
adjustment shall have no authority rel-
ative to interpretation of the adminis-
trative provisions of this code nor shall
the board be empowered to waive re-
guirements of either this code or the
technical codes which are the codes,

(Revised 7/10)



15.04.070

appendices and referenced code stan-
dards adopted by the city.
(Ord. 908 8§ 1 (Exh. A), 2010)

15.04.070 Amendmentsto International
Fire Code (IFC).

All requirements of the IFC shall be fol-
lowed unless otherwise amended in this sec-
tion.

A. Section 103.2 and 103.3 IFC Amended
(Department of Fire Prevention). Section
103.2 and 103.3 of the International Fire Code
is hereby amended to read as follows:

All references to “chief” or “fire code of-
ficial” within this chapter and within the
International Fire Code shall refer to
the City’s building official, who has the
authority to delegate these responsibil-
ities to the Chief of the Bellevue Fire
Department or to such members of the
Bellevue Fire Department to whom the
Chief may designate.

B. Section 105.1.1 IFC Amended (Permits
Required — Fees). Section 105.1.1 of the Inter-
national Fire Code is hereby amended to read
asfollows:

Permits required by this code shall be
obtained from the city building depart-
ment in conjunction with the fire code
official. The applicant shall submit
plans and data to the fire code official
for review and determination of compli-
ance with this code for a new home, a
substantial remodel or any other type
of project deemed necessary by the
building official that requires review
and compliance with this code. The
submittal shall contain sufficient data
as the fire code official shall require to
make a determination of compliance
with this code.

When the fire code official has deter-
mined a proposed project meets the
requirements of this Code or finds that
the proposed project is acceptable un-
der the code subiject to stipulated con-

(Revised 7/10) 15-8.6

ditions, they shall approve two sets of
plans. The approved plan sets shall be
incorporated into the approved set of
building permit documents together
with all conditions and inspection re-
guirements noted or required by code.

Issued permits shall be kept on the
premises designated therein at all
times and shall be readily available for
inspection by the fire code official.

The city council shall establish review,
permit and inspection fees by resolu-
tion. These fees shall be determined
according to the same process as is
used in determining building permit
fees.

(Ord. 908 § 1 (Exh. A), 2010)

15.04.080 Processing of permits.

Permits issued pursuant to this title shall be
processed as follows:

A. Building Permits.

1. Non-SEPA. Building permitsnot sub-
ject to the State Environmental Policy Act
(“SEPA”), as adopted by the city in CHMC
Title 18, shall be processed as Type | project
permit applications, as described in the chart
included in CHMC 19.01.003. Building per-
mits not subject to SEPA are exempt from the
project permit processing requirements, as
described in CHMC 19.01.007.

2. SEPA. Building permits subject to
SEPA shall be processed as Type Il project
permit applications, as described in the chart
included in CHMC 19.01.003.

B. Grading Permits. Grading permits shall
be processed in the same manner as building
permits in subsection (A) of this section.

C. Mechanical Permits. Mechanica per-
mits shall be processed as Type | project per-
mit applications, as described in the chart
included in CHMC 19.01.003. (Ord. 908 § 1
(Exh. A), 2010)



Clyde Hill Municipal Code

15.04.090 Landscape site and/or plan
review.

A. On-site landscaping review shal be
availableto any property owner within the city
upon request. Said review shall be for the pur-
pose of determining conformity of the trees or
other vegetation in any landscape plan with the
city’s list of recommended plantings and rec-
ommendations from the city’s urban forestry
program developed pursuant to Chapter 8.21
CHMC.

B. On-site landscaping review shal be
mandatory for those properties for which a
building permit has been applied for involving
any of the following:

1. Change in the footprint of the house
or other building on the property; or

2. Any exterior changes to the house or
other building on the property; or

3. Madification of landscaping is a part
of the project for which a permit is being
obtained.

C. The landscape plan and/or site review
with the property owner, contemplated by this
section, shall take place prior to final inspec-
tion of the work under the building permit.
Where the property owner intends to plant
trees or vegetation that may cause damage to
streets, sidewalks, overhead or underground
utility lines or which may impact views, the
reviewer will suggest aternatives from the
city’s list of recommended trees and vegeta-
tion and explain the benefits of such alterna-
tives.

D. The landscape plan examination shall
not be used to review any work that shall be
included and reviewed under the building per-
mit process. Work that shall not be reviewed
under the landscape plan examination
includes, but is not limited to, rockery, retain-
ing walls, architectural walls or planters,
paved pathways, driveways or other concrete
work, accessory structures, arbors/trellises,
fire pits/fireplaces, recreational courts, foun-
tains, pools, ponds, yard drainage or fences.
(Ord. 908 8§ 1 (Exh. A), 2010)

15-8.7

15.04.200

15.04.100 Reflective roofing prohibited —
Exceptions.

A. Any and al buildings constructed,
reconstructed and/or reroofed subsequent to
the effective date of the ordinance codified in
this section shall not have an exterior roof sur-
face consisting of any of the following materi-
as:

1. Unpainted galvanized or clear-coated
metal; or

2. White or aluminized reflective roof
covering or coating.

B. The applicant may apply to the building
official for permission to install prohibited
roofing materials. The building official may
allow such installation based upon the appli-
cant satisfying the following criteria:

1. Theroof will not create a safety haz-
ard to passing motorists or pedestrians; and

2. The roof will not adversely affect
neighboring property owners within a maxi-
mum radius of 300 feet, as measured from the
applicant’s property line. In ascertaining
whether the proposed roof will have an
adverse impact upon neighbors, the building
official may seek oral or written input from the
neighboring property owners within the
affected area. (Ord. 908 § 1 (Exh. A), 2010)

15.04.200 Violation — Penalty.

Any person, firm or corporation violating
any of the provisions of this chapter shall be
subject to enforcement under Chapter 15.13
CHMC. (Ord. 908 § 1 (Exh. A), 2010)

(Revised 7/10)



(Revised 7/10)

This page left intentionally blank.

15-8.8




ClydeHill Municipal Code

Chapter 15.06
MOVING OF BUILDINGS'

Sections:

15.06.010
15.06.020
15.06.030
15.06.040
15.06.050

Permit required.

Permit application.

Fees.

Performance bond.

Notice to adjoining property
owners.

Permit — Grounds for refusal.
Liability insurance required.
Revocation.

Permit application — Expiration.
Moving regulations generally.
Duties of permittee.

Inspection by building official.

15.06.060
15.06.070
15.06.080
15.06.090
15.06.100
15.06.110
15.06.120

15.06.010 Permit required.

It is unlawful for any person to move a
building along or across any public place or
street without a permit to do so from the city
building official. Building moving permits are
exempt from project permit processing, as
described in CHMC 19.01.007. (Ord. 743 8 3,
1996; Ord. 650 § 1, 1991)

15.06.020 Permit application.

In addition to other information reasonably
required by the building official, all applica-
tions for a permit to move a building shall pro-
vide a certificate of ownership or other
evidence of authority to move the building;
state the location of the building to be moved,
its dimensions and its principa materials;
describe the route over which the building isto
be moved and shall include a map showing the
route; describe the length of time that will be
required to moveit, the proposed date and time
of the move and the proposed destination.
(Ord. 650 § 1, 1991)

1. Prior legidation; Ords. 498 and 509.

15-9

15.06.060

15.06.030 Fees.

The cost of the permit to move a building
shall be a minimum of $150.00 and for such
additional amounts as determined by the build-
ing official to cover the actual coststo the city
including but not limited to the cost of apolice
escort to include at least one officer. If the
move requires additional officers, the appli-
cant shall pay the extra cost involved with a
four hour minimum on labor and equipment
charges. (Ord. 650 § 1, 1991)

15.06.040 Performance bond.

The applicant shall post with the city abond
of at least $2,500 to assure compliance with
the provisions of this chapter including specif-
ically that the streetsand the site are restored to
a clean and orderly condition. The amount
required of the bond may be increased by the
building official if the estimated costs of assur-
ing compliance are in excess of $2,500. The
bond shall be released by the building official
upon final inspection. (Ord. 650 § 1, 1991)

15.06.050 Noticeto adjoining property
owners.

The building official shall mail notice of the
proposed move to adjoining property owners,
provided that failureto do so shall not giverise
toany liability onthe part of thecity. (Ord. 650
81, 1991)

15.06.060 Permit —Groundsfor refusal.

The building official shall refuse to issue a
permit if he finds that:

A. Any application requirement or any fee
or bond requirement has not been complied
with;

B. The building is too large to move with-
out endangering persons or property in the
city;

C. Thebuilding isin such a state of deteri-
oration, disrepair or is otherwise so structur-
aly unsafe that it could not be moved without
endangering persons and property in the city;



15.06.070

D. The building is structurally unsafe or
unfit for the purpose for which moved, if the
removal location isin the city;

E. The applicant’s equipment is unsafe and
persons and property would be endangered by
its use;

F. The zoning code, building code, fire
code or other ordinances would be violated by
the building in its new location or that the
applicant has failed to obtain the necessary
permits for all work required in order to com-
ply with such ordinances;

G. For any other reason persons or property
in the city would be endangered by the moving
of the building. (Ord. 650 § 1, 1991)

15.06.070 Liability insurancerequired.

No permit to moveabuilding shall beissued
unless the applicant has furnished the city
clerk a certificate of insurance evidencing lia-
bility coverage for this move and a copy of the
endorsement showing proof that the city is
named as an additional insured on the appli-
cant’s public liability insurance policy. The
insurance policy shall providefor alimit of not
less than $1,000,000 combined single limit per
occurrence. The insurance shall state that the
city clerk must be given aminimum of 20 days
notice of any material change, cancellation or
expiration of such insurance policy. (Ord. 650
81, 1991)

15.06.080 Revocation.

In the event anyone granted a permit under
this chapter failsto comply with the terms and
conditions of the permit or this chapter, the
permit may be revoked by the building official
after notice to the permit holder. (Ord. 650 § 1,
1991)

15.06.090 Permit application — Expiration.

A complete application with all insurance,
bonds and fees necessary for a permit to move
abuilding must be submitted to the city amin-
imum of at least 14 days prior to the actua
moving of the building.

15-10

The permit shall expire 90 days after date of
issue. (Ord. 650 § 1, 1991)

15.06.100 Moving regulations generally.

All house moves are to be accomplished
between the hours of 10:00 p.m. and 6:00 am.
Speed isto be reasonable and prudent as deter-
mined by the police department. Red or amber
flashing lights shall be displayed on all four
corners of the load. Pilot cars shall follow
immediately ahead and behind, displaying
amber lights and signs describing aload. Flag-
men shall be available to control traffic where
required by the city. There shall be no Satur-
day, Sunday or holiday moving, except as
approved by the city building official. (Ord.
650 § 1, 1991)

15.06.110 Dutiesof per mittee.

Every permittee under this chapter shall:

A. Use Designated Streets. Move a build-
ing only over streets designated for such usein
the written permit.

B. Notify of Revised Moving Time. Notify
the building official in writing of a desired
change in moving date and hours as proposed
in the application.

C. Notify of Damage. Notify the building
official in writing of any and all damage done
to property belonging to the city within 24
hours after the damage or injury has occurred.

D. Overhead Utilities. Assumeall responsi-
bility for protection of overhead utilities and
structures and obtain any necessary permission
from the utilities involved.

E. Street Occupancy Period. Remove the
building from the city streets and rights of way
after two days of such occupancy, unless an
extension is granted by the building official.

F. Comply with Governing Law. Within six
months from the date of issuance of the permit,
comply with the city building, fire and zoning
ordinances, and all other applicable ordinances
and laws upon relocating the building in the
city. The applicant shall obtain all necessary



ClydeHill Municipal Code

permits for such compliance prior to moving
the building from its original site.

G. Clear Old Premises. Within 48 hours of
the building move, shall remove all rubbish
and materials and fill al excavations to exist-
ing grade at the original building site and do
such other things as directed by the building
official so that the premises are left in a safe
and sanitary condition. (Ord. 650 § 1, 1991)

15.06.120 Inspection by building official.
All equipment being used to move the build-
ing shall be subject to inspection by the build-
ing official prior to the move. The building
officia shall aso inspect after the move to
make sure there is no damage to roads and that
theareaisclean. (Ord. 650 § 1, 1991)

15-11

15.07.020

Chapter 15.07
BUILDING DEMOLITION

Sections:

15.07.010 Permit required.

15.07.020 Application, investigation and
permit issuance.

15.07.030 Demalition.

15.07.010 Permit required.

No building or structure shall be demolished
unless: (1) an application is made for a sepa-
rate permit as set forth in CHMC 15.04.020;
(2) al necessary information has been submit-
ted to the building official as provided in this
chapter; and (3) a permit has been issued.
Building demolition permits are exempt from
project permit processing, as described in
CHMC 19.01.007. (Ord. 743 § 4, 1996; Ord.
674 81, 1993)

15.07.020 Application, investigation and
per mit issuance.

A. Application Contents. An application
shall be filed with the building official for a
demolition permit, and/or for the use of street
or walk area deemed necessary for building
demolition operations. The application shall
specify the period of time needed to complete
demolition, and the period of timethe applicant
desires to use the public areas. In addition, the
application shall be accompanied by aplan for
demolition, which shall depict the property
upon which the demolition operationswill take
place, and any other abutting public or private
area which may be affected by these opera-
tions. The plan shall demonstrate that adequate
measureswill be taken by the permittee for silt
and drainage runoff protection to adjacent pub-
lic and private properties, both during and after
demolition operations have terminated.

B. Investigation. The building official shall
inspect the area of demolition prior to permit
issuance, and the public areas adjacent to the
place of demolition to determine the traffic
carried by the adjacent roadway and walks,



15.07.030

and to determine the inconvenience and hazard
to the public. Another inspection shall be done
by the building official after demolition to
determine the permittee’ s compliance with the
terms of the permit, to thereby release any
bond required under subsection (D) of this sec-
tion.

C. Limits of Use of Public Property. The
building officia has the discretion to limit the
use of any public or street area, where individ-
ual circumstances would make such use of the
public or street area hazardous to the public.

D. Permit Issuance. Upon completion of the
investigation of the proposed demoalition
and/or use of the public area, the building offi-
cial may grant the requested permit, subject to
theapplicant’ sfurnishing publicliability insur-
ance and a cash deposit and/or surety bonds as
said official deemsnecessary to protect the city
from any claims for damages to persons or
Injury to public utilitiesor any causearising out
of the use of the public area. The building offi-
cial may revise the applicant’s or permittee’s
plans and confine the use of the walk or street
area to the area the officia finds to alow the
greatest safety to the public. The building offi-
cial may ater conditions of the permit at any
time said official findsthat such use may cause
damageto personsor things, or to any improve-
ments of the city. The building officia shall
judge the adequacy of protective devices
installed in any street area to safeguard utility
and traffic facility devices.

E. Permit Expiration. Any demolition per-
mit issued under this chapter shall automati-
cally expire 30 days after the date of issuance.
(Ord. 674 81, 1993)

15.07.030 Demoalition.

Demolition operations shall be conducted in
accordance with all applicable local, state and
federal law, including, but not limited to,
CHMC 8.10.030(E). Any permit issued under
this chapter shall further be conditioned on the
permittee’ s compliance with the following:

15-12

A. Removal of Earth and Debris. Earth
taken from excavations and rubbish from
buildings shall not be stored on the sidewalk or
other street area, but shall be removed daily as
rapidly as produced. Where such materials are
dry and apt to produce dust when handled, they
shall be kept sufficiently moist to prevent the
wind blowing the same about. The permittee
shall keep all walks and street areas clean and
free from mud and debris as required by the
building official.

B. Clean Premises. The permittee shal
remove all rubbish and materials and fill all
excavations to existing grade at the original
building site, and accomplish such other tasks
as directed by the building official so that the
premises are left in a safe and sanitary condi-
tion.

C. Disconnection and Capping of Utilities.
Prior to demolition operations, the permittee
shall disconnect and cap off al utilities
(including, but not limited to, sanitary sewer,
gas lines and water lines). The location of
remaining, capped utilities shall be clearly
marked by the permittee on the site.

D. Removal of Underground Tanks. In con-
junction with the demolition operations, the
permittee shall remove and properly dispose of
al underground tanks (including, but not lim-
ited to, oil and gas tanks) as required by all
applicable local, state and federal law.

E. Drainage. The permittee shall protect the
adjacent private and public propertiesfrom silt
and drainage runoff both during and after dem-
olition operations, all as provided in the plans
submitted with the application, and to the sat-
isfaction of the building official. Therelease of
any cash deposit or surety bonds required by
the building official under CHMC 15.07.020
(D) may be conditioned upon the permittee’s
compliance with this condition.

F. Pedestrian Protection and Traffic Con-
trol. The permittee shall comply with all safety
requirements imposed by the building official
on work adjacent to public walks and streets,
including but not limited to, the use of flag per-






Clyde Hill Municipal Code

increased, redirected or otherwise made detri-
mental to the use or maintenance of adjacent
property; and

2. This restriction shall not prevent the
installation and maintenance of a covered
storm sewer system under or across private
property for the purpose of generally improv-
ing a particular property, in conformance with
specifications and plans meeting the approval
of the city engineer and consistent with the
city’s publication entitled “Stormwater Drain-
age Guidelines,” dated January 2008, or as
thereafter amended.

B. Drainage Control Plan. Two copies of a
drainage control plan must be submitted to the
public works director for all new construction,
additions, storage sheds, new or reconstructed
patios, sidewalks, game courts, driveways, and
any other impervious surfaces, as defined in
CHMC 17.04.255 (Impervious coverage). The
required content of the drainage control plan is
described in the city’s publication entitled
“Stormwater Drainage Guidelines,” dated Jan-
uary 2008, or as thereafter amended.

C. Collected waters, including but not lim-
ited to such waters as may be collected from
roof downspout drains, surface drains, drive-
ways, patios, yard area drains or foundation
drains, shall be discharged into storm sewer
facilities where connection thereto will not
cause significant disruption of public streets.
Installation of storm sewer facilities in the
public right-of-way shall be performed in
accordance with Chapter 12.08 CHMC.

D. Where the storm sewer facilities are not
available, other means as may be approved by
the city engineer shall be provided for disposal
of collected waters. Collected waters shall not
be permitted to discharge onto adjacent public
or private property.

E. A storm detention system shall be
required when a net total of 750 square feet or
more of additional impervious surface area is
added to a lot. In calculating the impervious
surface area, the surface of the water of swim-

15-20a

15.10.060

ming pools shall not be included, unless the
public works director determines that such
pool contributes to surface water runoff.

F. When a lot is newly developed or rede-
veloped, or when the main structure thereon is
deemed “‘substantially damaged or destroyed”
or “substantially remodeled” as defined in
CHMC 17.60.030, a storm detention system
shall be required to capture, store and release
stormwater at the rates allowed by the city’s
publication described in subsection (B) of this
section. (Ord. 905 § 2, 2010)

15.10.040 Applicability — Requirements for
development one acre or greater.
The remainder of this chapter applies to all
development, redevelopment, and construc-
tion site activities, including projects less than
one acre that are part of a larger common plan
of development or sale, that result in land dis-
turbance of equal or greater than one acre
where stormwater from the site drains into the
city of Clyde Hill’s municipal storm sewer
system, unless specifically exempted by the
city. (Ord. 905 § 2, 2010)

15.10.050 Definitions.

For all development, redevelopment, and
construction site activities resulting in a land
disturbance of equal or greater than one acre,
including projects less than one acre that are
part of a larger common plan of development
or sale, the definitions published in Appendix
1 of the Western Washington Phase II munici-
pal stormwater permit shall govern. (Ord. 905
§ 2,2010)

15.10.060 Stormwater drainage
requirements — Development one
acre or greater (43,560 square
feet).

A. For all new development, redevelop-
ment, and construction site activities that result
in land disturbance of equal or greater than one
acre, including projects less than one acre that
are part of a larger common plan of develop-

(Revised 4/10)



15.10.070

ment or sale, two copies of a drainage control
plan meeting the requirements of the most cur-
rent adopted version of the Washington State
Department of Ecology’s Stormwater Man-
agement Manual for Western Washington
must be submitted to the public works director.
The technical thresholds published in Appen-
dix 1 of the Western Washington Phase II
municipal stormwater permit will apply to
determine which of the minimum require-
ments published in the same Appendix 1 will
be applied to the project. The technical thresh-
olds and minimum requirements contained in
Appendix 1 apply to all new development,
redevelopment, and construction site activi-
ties, whether public or private, including the
construction of roads.

B. The technical thresholds and minimum
requirements as published in Appendix 1 of
the Western Washington Phase II municipal
stormwater permit are incorporated herein.
(Ord. 905 § 2, 2010)

15.10.070 Adjustment and variance
criteria.

The following adjustment and variance cri-
teria apply only to all new development, rede-
velopment, and construction site activities that
result in land disturbance of equal or greater
than one acre, including projects less than one
acre that are part of a larger common plan of
development or sale.

A. Adjustments to the minimum require-
ments contained in Appendix 1 of the Western
Washington Phase II municipal stormwater
permit may be granted by the city upon appli-
cation; provided, that a written finding of fact
is prepared addressing the following:

1. The adjustment provides substantially
equivalent environmental protections as those
required by the Western Washington Phase II
municipal stormwater permit;

2. Based on sound engineering prac-
tices, the objectives of safety, function, envi-
ronmental protection and facility maintenance
are met.

(Revised 4/10) 15-20b

B. Exceptions or variances to the minimum
requirements contained in Appendix 1 of the
Western Washington Phase II municipal
stormwater permit may be granted prior to per-
mit approval and construction. The board of
adjustment may grant a variance following
legal public notice of an application for an
exception, legal public notice of the decision
on the application, and written findings of fact.
The application must address each of the fac-
tors listed below and must be submitted with
the applicable fee, established in the city’s
master fee resolution. Exceptions to the mini-
mum requirements may be granted if their
application imposes a severe and unexpected
economic hardship. To determine whether the
application of the minimum requirements
imposes a severe and unexpected economic
hardship on the applicant, the board of adjust-
ment must consider and document with written
findings of fact the following:

1. The current (preproject) use of the
site;

2. How the application of the minimum
requirement(s) restricts the proposed use of the
site compared to the restrictions that existed
prior to the adoption of the minimum require-
ments;

3. The possible remaining uses of the
site if the exception were not granted;

4. The uses of the site that would have
been allowed prior to the adoption of the min-
imum requirements;

5. A comparison of the estimated
amount and percentage of value loss as a result
of the minimum requirements versus the esti-
mated amount and percentage of value loss as
a result of requirements that existed prior to
adoption of the minimum requirements; and

6. The feasibility for the owner to alter
the project to apply the minimum require-
ments.

In addition, any exception must meet the
following criteria:

a. That the granting of the exception
will not be detrimental to the public health and



Clyde Hill Municipal Code

welfare, nor injurious to other properties in the
vicinity and/or downstream, and to the quality
of waters of the state; and
b. The exception is the least possible

exception that could be granted to comply with
the intent of the minimum requirements.

If an exception or variance is granted, at
a minimum, the stormwater drainage require-
ments established in CHMC 15.10.030 for
development less than one acre must continue
to apply. (Ord. 905 § 2, 2010)

15.10.080 Site planning and BMP selection
and design criteria.

The city adopts the site planning process,
BMP selection and design criteria contained in
the most current version of the Washington
State Department of Ecology’s Stormwater
Management Manual for Western Washington
that, when used to implement the minimum
requirements in Appendix 1 of the Western
Washington Phase II municipal stormwater
permit, will protect water quality, reduce the
discharge of pollutants to the maximum extent
practicable and satisfy the state requirement
under Chapter 90.48 RCW to apply all known,
available and reasonable methods of preven-
tion, control and treatment prior to discharge.
(Ord. 905 § 2, 2010)

15.10.090 Low impact development.

In order to promote low impact develop-
ment using creative approaches to site design,
habitat and tree retention, significant reduction
of impervious surfaces, changes in traditional
site features such as roads and structures in
favor of natural habitat features, the director
may approve, or for those projects requiring
review and approval by the city council, rec-
ommend approval of deviations from engi-
neering design and the provisions of Clyde
Hill’s development regulations for all develop-
ment, redevelopment, and construction site
activities that result in land disturbance of
equal or greater than one acre based upon the
following factors:

15-20c¢

15.10.090

A. The deviations will produce a compen-
sating or comparable result in stormwater flow
control and treatment that is in the public inter-
est;

B. The deviations contribute to and are con-
sistent with the goal of achieving low effective
impervious surface area within a development;

C. The proposed development project offers
reasonable assurances that low impervious
surfaces will be achieved and maintained;

D. The deviations do not threaten public
health or safety;

E. The deviations are consistent with gener-
ally accepted engineering and design practices
and are prepared by a registered professional
engineer licensed in the state of Washington
with experience in LID design;

F. The deviations promote one or more of
the following:

1. Innovative site or housing design;

2. Increased on-site stormwater reten-
tion using native vegetation;

3. Retention of at least 60 percent of nat-
ural vegetation conditions over the site;

4. Improved on-site water quality
beyond that required by current applicable reg-
ulations;

5. Retention or recreation of predevel-
opment and/or natural hydrologic conditions
to the maximum extent possible;

6. The reduction of effective impervious
surfaces to the maximum extent practicable;

G. The deviations do not allow density
greater than what would otherwise be allowed
under city regulations then in effect;

H. The deviations do not present signifi-
cantly greater maintenance requirements at
facilities that will be eventually transferred to
public ownership;

I. There shall be submitted in conjunction
with each such project, covenants, conditions
and restrictions which will be binding upon the
property all necessary native growth protec-
tion easements, impervious surface restrictions
and such other critical features as the director
may require.

(Revised 4/10)



15.10.100

Deviations to promote low impact develop-
ment shall not be available for any develop-
ment, redevelopment, or construction
activities resulting in a land disturbance of less
than one acre. Furthermore, deviations are
available only in those areas designated by the
city administrator in consultation with the pub-
lic works director.

Prior to final approval of the LID facility
construction, a registered professional engi-
neer licensed in the state of Washington and
experienced in LID design shall submit to the
city as built plans of the LID facility and certi-
fication that the facility has been constructed
as shown on the as built plans. (Ord. 905 § 2,
2010)

15.10.100 Long-term operation and
maintenance of post-
construction stormwater
facilities.

A. The person or persons holding title to the
property shall remain responsible for the facil-
ity’s continual performance, operation and
maintenance in accordance with the standards
and requirements of the most current version
of the Washington State Department of Ecol-
ogy’s Stormwater Management Manual for
Western Washington and remain responsible
for any liability as a result of these duties.

B. The city is authorized to inspect a private
stormwater drainage facility at least annually
unless there are maintenance records justifying
a different frequency pursuant to CHMC
15.10.110. (Ord. 905 § 2, 2010)

15.10.110 Inspection.

A. Authority. Whenever implementing the
provisions of this chapter or whenever there is
cause to believe that a violation of this chapter
has been or is being committed, the city’s
inspector is authorized to inspect during regu-
lar working hours and at other reasonable
times all new development, redevelopment,

(Revised 4/10) 15-20d

and construction sites within Clyde Hill to
determine compliance with the provisions of
this chapter.

B. Inspection Procedures.

1. Prior to making any inspections on
private property, the inspector shall present
identification credentials, state the reason for
the inspection and request entry. Any private
landowner engaging in new development,
redevelopment, or construction activities as
defined under this chapter must, as a condition
of the building permit required for such devel-
opment, consent to the creation of an easement
for purposes of ingress and egress for inspec-
tion of the site.

2. If the property or any building or
structure on the property is unoccupied, the
inspector shall first make a reasonable effort to
locate the owner or other person(s) having
charge or control of the property or portions of
the property and request entry.

3. If after reasonable effort the inspector
is unable to locate the owner or other person(s)
having charge or control of the property, and
has reason to believe the condition of the
stormwater system creates an imminent hazard
to persons or property, the inspector may enter.

4. Unless entry is consented to by the
owner or person(s) in control of the property or
portion of the property or unless conditions are
reasonably believed to exist which create
imminent hazard, the inspector shall obtain a
search warrant, prior to entry, as authorized by
the laws of the state of Washington.

5. The inspector may inspect the storm-
water system without obtaining a search war-
rant provided for in subsection (B)(4) of this
section, provided the inspection can be con-
ducted while remaining on public property or
other property on which permission to enter is
obtained.

C. Inspection Requirements. The director is
authorized to develop inspection procedures
and requirements, including checklists, for all
stormwater facilities in the city of Clyde Hill.



Clyde Hill Municipal Code 15.10.120

D. Inspection Fees. Inspection fees shall be
established by the city’s master fee resolution.
(Ord. 905 § 2, 2010)

15.10.120 Enforcement.

Any person violating the provisions of this
chapter shall be subject to those penalties out-
lined in Chapter 15.13 CHMC. (Ord. 905 § 2,
2010)

15-20e (Revised 4/10)



(Revised 4/10)

This page left intentionally blank.

15-20f




Clyde Hill Municipal Code

Chapter 15.11
FLOOD HAZARD REDUCTION

Sections:

15.11.010 Definitions.

15.11.020 General provisions.

15.11.030 Administration.

15.11.040 Provisions for flood hazard
reduction.

15.11.010 Definitions.

“Appeal” means a request for a review of
the interpretation of any provision of this chap-
ter or a request for a variance.

“Area of special flood hazard” is the land in
the floodplain within a community subject to a
one percent or greater chance of flooding in
any given year. Designation on maps always
includes the letters A or V.

“Base flood” means the flood having a one
percent chance of being equaled or exceeded
in any given year (also referred to as the “100-
year flood”). Designated on flood insurance
rate maps by the letters A or V.

“Basement” means any area of the building
having its floor sub-grade (below ground
level) on all sides.

“Development” means any manmade
change to improved or unimproved real estate,
including but not limited to buildings or other
structures, mining, dredging, filling, grading,
paving, excavation or drilling operations or
storage of equipment or materials located
within the area of special flood hazard.

“Elevated building” means, for insurance
purposes, a nonbasement building that has its
lowest elevated floor raised above ground
level by foundation walls, shear walls, posts,
piers, pilings, or columns.

“Flood” or “flooding” means a general and
temporary condition of partial or complete
inundation of normally dry land areas from:

1. The overflow of inland or tidal
waters; and/or

2. The unusual and rapid accumulation
of runoff of surface waters from any source.

15-20.1

15.11.010

“Flood insurance rate map (FIRM)” means
the official map on which the Federal Insur-
ance Administration has delineated both the
areas of special flood hazard and the risk pre-
mium zones applicable to the community.

“Flood insurance study (FIS)” means the
official report provided by the Federal Insur-
ance Administration that includes flood pro-
files, the flood insurance rate maps, and the
water surface elevation of the base flood.

“Floodway” means the channel of a river or
other watercourse and the adjacent land areas
that must be reserved in order to discharge the
base flood without cumulatively increasing the
water surface elevation more than one foot.

“Lowest floor” means the lowest floor of the
lowest enclosed area (including basement). An
unfinished or flood resistant enclosure, usable
solely for parking of vehicles, building access,
or storage in an area other than a basement
area, is not considered a building’s lowest
floor; provided, that such enclosure is not built
so as to render the structure in violation of the
applicable nonelevation design requirements
of this chapter found at CHMC 15.11.040(B)
(i.e., provided there are adequate flood ventila-
tion openings).

“Manufactured home” means a structure,
transportable in one or more sections, which is
built on a permanent chassis and is designed
for use with or without a permanent foundation
when attached to the required utilities. The
term “manufactured home” does not include a
recreational vehicle.

“New construction” means structures for
which the start of construction commenced on
or after the effective date of the ordinance cod-
ified in this chapter.

“Recreational vehicle” means a vehicle:

1. Built on a single chassis;

2. Four hundred square feet or less when
measured at the largest horizontal projection;

3. Designed to be self-propelled or per-
manently towable by a light duty truck; and

4. Designed primarily not for use as a
permanent dwelling but as temporary living

(Revised 5/09)



15.11.020

quarters for recreational, camping, travel, or
seasonal use.

“Start of construction” includes substantial
improvement, and means the date the building
permit was issued, provided the actual start of
construction, repair, reconstruction, placement
or other improvement was within 180 days of
the permit date. The “actual start” means either
the first placement of permanent construction
of a structure on a site, such as the pouring of
slab or footings, the installation of piles, the
construction of columns, or any work beyond
the stage of excavation; or the placement of a
manufactured home on a foundation. Perma-
nent construction does not include land prepa-
ration, such as clearing, grading and filling;
nor does it include the installation of streets
and/or walkways; nor does it include excava-
tion for a basement, footings, piers, or founda-
tions or the erection of temporary forms; nor
does it include the installation on the property
of accessory buildings, such as garages or
sheds not occupied as dwelling units or not
part of the main structure. For a substantial
improvement, the “actual start of construc-
tion” means the first alteration of any wall,
ceiling, floor, or other structural part of a
building, whether or not that alteration affects
the external dimensions of the building.

“Structure” means a walled and roofed
building, including a gas or liquid storage tank
that is principally above ground.

“Substantial damage” means damage of any
origin sustained by a structure whereby the
cost of restoring the structure to its before-
damaged condition would equal or exceed 50
percent of the market value of the structure
before the damage occurred.

“Substantial improvement” means any
repair, reconstruction, or improvement of a
structure the cost of which equals or exceeds
50 percent of the market value of the structure
either:

1. Before the improvement or repair is
started; or

(Revised 5/09)

15-20.2

2. If the structure has been damaged and
is being restored, before the damage occurred.
For the purposes of this definition “substantial
improvement” is considered to occur when the
first alteration of any wall, ceiling, floor, or
other structural part of the building com-
mences, whether or not that alteration affects
the external dimensions of the structure.

The term can exclude:

1. Any project for improvement of a
structure to correct pre-cited existing viola-
tions of state or local health, sanitary, or safety
code specifications which have been previ-
ously identified by the local code enforcement
official and which are the minimum necessary
to assure safe living conditions; or

2. Any alteration of a structure listed on
the National Register of Historic Places or a
State Inventory of Historic Places.

“Variance” means a grant of relief from the
requirements of this chapter that permits con-
struction in a manner that would otherwise be
prohibited by this chapter. (Ord. 892 § 1, 2008;
Ord. 891 § 1, 2008)

15.11.020 General provisions.

A. Lands to Which This Chapter Applies.
This chapter shall apply to all areas of special
flood hazard within the city of Clyde Hill.

B. Basis for Establishing the Areas of Spe-
cial Flood Hazard. Areas of special flood haz-
ard within the city shall be those areas that may
be identified by the Federal Insurance Admin-
istration in a scientific and engineering report
entitled “The Flood Insurance Study for the
City of Clyde Hill,” and any revisions thereto,
with an accompanying flood insurance rate
map (FIRM), and any revisions thereto, which
documents are hereby adopted by reference
and declared to be a part of this chapter. Any
such flood insurance study and the FIRM shall
be maintained on file at the City Hall, 9605 NE
24th Street, Clyde Hill, Washington 98004.
The best available information for flood haz-
ard area identification as outlined in CHMC



Clyde Hill Municipal Code

15.11.030(C)(2) shall be the basis for regula-
tion until a FIRM is issued that incorporates
data utilized under CHMC 15.11.030(C)(2).

C. Warning and Disclaimer of Liability.
The degree of flood protection required by this
chapter is considered reasonable for regulatory
purposes and is based on scientific and engi-
neering considerations. Larger floods can and
will occur on rare occasions. Flood heights
may be increased by manmade or natural
causes. This chapter does not imply that land
outside the areas of special flood hazard or
uses permitted within such areas will be free
from flooding or flood damages. This chapter
shall not create liability on the part of the city,
any officer or employee thereof, or the Federal
Insurance Administration for any flood dam-
ages that result from reliance on this chapter or
any administrative decision lawfully made
hereunder. (Ord. 892 § 1, 2008; Ord. 891 § 1,
2008)

15.11.030 Administration.
A. Establishment of Development Permit.

1. Development Permit Required. A
development permit shall be obtained before
construction or development begins within any
area of special flood hazard established in
CHMC 15.11.020(B). The permit shall be for
all structures and for all development includ-
ing fill and other activities.

2. Application for Development Permit.
Application for a development permit shall be
made on forms furnished by the city and may
include, but not be limited to, plans in dupli-
cate drawn to scale showing the nature, loca-
tion, dimensions, and elevations of the area in
question; existing or proposed structures, fill,
storage of materials, drainage facilities, and
the location of the foregoing. Specifically, the
following information is required:

a. Elevation in relation to mean sea
level of the lowest floor (including basement)
of all structures recorded on a current elevation
certificate (FF 81-31) with Section B com-
pleted by the local official;

15-20.3

15.11.030

b. Elevation in relation to mean sea
level to which any structure has been flood-
proofed;

c. Certification by a registered pro-
fessional engineer or architect that the flood-
proofing methods for any nonresidential
structure meet floodproofing criteria in CHMC
15.11.040(B)(2);

d. Description of the extent to which
a watercourse will be altered or relocated as a
result of proposed development.

B. Designation of the Local Administrator.
The city engineer is hereby appointed to
administer and implement this chapter by
granting or denying development permit appli-
cations in accordance with its provisions.

C. Duties and Responsibilities of the Local
Administrator. Duties of the local administra-
tor shall include, but not be limited to:

1. Permit Review.

a. Review all development permits to
determine that the permit requirements of this
chapter have been satisfied.

b. Review all development permits to
determine that all necessary permits have been
obtained from those federal, state, or local
governmental agencies from which prior
approval is required.

c. Review all development permits to
determine if the proposed development is
located in the floodway. If located in the flood-
way, assure that the encroachment provisions
of CHMC 15.11.040(D)(1) are met.

2. Use of Other Base Flood Data (in A
and V Zones). When base flood elevation data
has not been provided (in A or V Zones) in
accordance with CHMC 15.11.020(B), Basis
for Establishing the Areas of Special Flood
Hazard, the city engineer shall obtain, review,
and reasonably utilize any base flood elevation
and floodway data available from a federal,
state or other source, in order to administer
CHMC 15.11.040(B), Specific Standards, and
15.11.040(D), Floodways.

(Revised 5/09)



15.11.030

3. Information to Be Obtained and
Maintained.

a. Where base flood elevation data is
provided through the flood insurance study,
FIRM, or required as in subsection (C)(2) of
this section, obtain and record the actual (as-
built) elevation (in relation to mean sea level of
the lowest floor (including basement) of all
new or substantially improved structures, and
whether or not the structure contains a base-
ment. Recorded on a current elevation certifi-
cate (FF 81-31) with Section B completed by
the local official.

b. For all new or substantially
improved floodproofed nonresidential struc-
tures where base flood elevation data is pro-
vided through the FIS, FIRM, or as required in
subsection (C)(2) of this section:

i. Obtain and record the elevation
(in relation to mean sea level) to which the
structure was floodproofed.

ii. Maintain the floodproofing cer-
tifications required in subsection (A)(2) of this
section.

¢. Maintain for public inspection all
records pertaining to the provisions of this
chapter.

4. Alteration of Watercourses.

a. Notify adjacent communities and
the Department of Ecology prior to any alter-
ation or relocation of a watercourse, and sub-
mit evidence of such notification to the Federal
Insurance Administration.

b. Require that maintenance be pro-
vided within the altered or relocated portion of
said watercourse so that the flood carrying
capacity is not diminished.

D. Conditions for Variances.

1. Generally, the only condition under
which a variance from the elevation standard
may be issued is for new construction and sub-
stantial improvements to be erected on a small
or irregularly shaped lot contiguous to and sur-
rounded by lots with existing structures con-
structed below the base flood level. As the lot

(Revised 5/09)

15-20.4

size increases, the technical justification
required for issuing the variance increases.

2. Variances shall not be issued within a
designated floodway if any increase in flood
levels during the base flood discharge would
result.

3. Variances shall only be issued upon a
determination that the variance is the mini-
mum necessary, considering the flood hazard,
to afford relief.

4. Variances shall only be issued upon:

a. A showing of good and sufficient
cause;

b. A determination that failure to
grant the variance would result in exceptional
hardship to the applicant;

c. A determination that the granting
of a variance will not result in increased flood
heights, additional threats to public safety,
extraordinary public expense, create nui-
sances, cause fraud on or victimization of the
public, or conflict with existing local laws or
ordinances.

5. Variances as interpreted in the
National Flood Insurance Program are based
on the general zoning law principle that they
pertain to a physical piece of property; they are
not personal in nature and do not pertain to the
structure, its inhabitants, economic or financial
circumstances. They primarily address small
lots in densely populated residential neighbor-
hoods. As such, variances from flood eleva-
tions should be quite rare.

6. Variances may be issued for nonresi-
dential buildings in very limited circumstances
to allow a lesser degree of floodproofing than
watertight or dry floodproofing, where it can
be determined that such action will have low
damage potential, complies with all other vari-
ance criteria except subsection (D)(1) of this
section, and otherwise complies with CHMC
15.11.040(A)(1), (3) and (4) of the general
standards.

7. Any applicant to whom a variance is
granted shall be given written notice that the
permitted structure will be built with its lowest



Clyde Hill Municipal Code

floor below the base flood elevation and that
the cost of flood insurance will be commensu-
rate with the increased risk. (Ord. 892 § 1,
2008; Ord. 891 § 1, 2008)

15.11.040 Provisions for flood hazard
reduction.

A. General Standards. In all areas of special
flood hazard, the following standards are
required:

1. Anchoring.

a. All new construction and substan-
tial improvements shall be anchored to prevent
flotation, collapse, or lateral movement of the
structure.

b. All manufactured homes shall be
anchored to prevent flotation, collapse, or lat-
eral movement, and shall be installed using
methods and practices that minimize flood
damage. Anchoring methods may include, but
are not limited to, use of over-the-top or frame
ties to ground anchors.

2. Construction Materials and Methods.

a. All new construction and substan-
tial improvements shall be constructed with
materials and utility equipment resistant to
flood damage.

b. All new construction and substan-
tial improvements shall be constructed using
methods and practices that minimize flood
damage.

c. Electrical, heating, ventilation,
plumbing, and air-conditioning equipment and
other service facilities shall be designed and/or
otherwise elevated or located so as to prevent
water from entering or accumulating within
the components during conditions of flooding.
Locating such equipment below the base flood
elevation may cause annual flood insurance
premiums to be increased.

3. Utilities.

a. All new and replacement water
supply systems shall be designed to minimize
or eliminate infiltration of floodwaters into the
systems;

15-20.5

15.11.040

b. Water wells shall be located on
high ground that is not in the floodway;

c. New and replacement sanitary
sewage systems shall be designed to minimize
or eliminate infiltration of floodwaters into the
systems and discharges from the systems into
floodwaters;

d. On-site waste disposal systems
shall be located to avoid impairment to them or
contamination from them during flooding.

4. Subdivision Proposals.

a. All subdivision proposals shall be
consistent with the need to minimize flood
damage;

b. All subdivision proposals shall
have public utilities and facilities, such as
sewer, gas, electrical, and water systems
located and constructed to minimize or elimi-
nate flood damage;

c. All subdivision proposals shall
have adequate drainage provided to reduce
exposure to flood damage;

d. Where base flood elevation data
has not been provided or is not available from
another authoritative source, it shall be gener-
ated for subdivision proposals and other pro-
posed developments which contain at least 50
lots or five acres (whichever is less).

5. Review of Building Permits. Where
elevation data is not available either through
the flood insurance study, FIRM, or from
another  authoritative  source (CHMC
15.11.030(C)(2), applications for building per-
mits shall be reviewed to assure that proposed
construction will be reasonably safe from
flooding. The test of reasonableness is a local
judgment and includes use of historical data,
high water marks, photographs of past flood-
ing, etc., where available. Failure to elevate at
least two feet above the highest adjacent grade
in these zones may result in higher insurance
rates.

B. Specific Standards. In all areas of spe-
cial flood hazard where base flood elevation
data has been provided as set forth in CHMC
15.11.020(B), Basis for Establishing the Areas

(Revised 5/09)



15.11.040

of Special Flood Hazard, or CHMC
15.11.030(C)(2), Use of Other Base Flood
Data. Additional standards were clarified in
FEMA Technical Bulletin 11-01 to allow
crawlspace construction for buildings located
in the special flood hazard areas; however,
adopting this provision can result in a 20 per-
cent increase in flood insurance premiums.
The following provisions are required:

1. Residential Construction.

a. New construction and substantial
improvement of any residential structure shall
have the lowest floor, including basement, ele-
vated one foot or more above the base flood
elevation (BFE).

b. Fully enclosed areas below the
lowest floor that are subject to flooding are
prohibited, or shall be designed to automati-
cally equalize hydrostatic flood forces on exte-
rior walls by allowing for the entry and exit of
floodwaters. Designs for meeting this require-
ment must either be certified by a registered
professional engineer or architect or must meet
or exceed the following minimum criteria:

i. A minimum of two openings
having a total net area of not less than one
square inch for every square foot of enclosed
area subject to flooding shall be provided.

ii. The bottom of all openings
shall be no higher than one foot above grade.

iii. Openings may be equipped
with screens, louvers, or other coverings or
devices; provided, that they permit the auto-
matic entry and exit of floodwaters.

2. Nonresidential Construction. New
construction and substantial improvement of
any commercial, industrial or other nonresi-
dential structure shall either have the lowest
floor, including basement, elevated one foot or
more above the base flood elevation; or,
together with attendant utility and sanitary
facilities, shall:

a. Be floodproofed so that below one
foot or more above the base flood level the
structure is watertight with walls substantially
impermeable to the passage of water;

(Revised 5/09)

15-20.6

b. Have structural components capa-
ble of resisting hydrostatic and hydrodynamic
loads and effects of buoyancy;

c. Be certified by a registered profes-
sional engineer or architect that the design and
methods of construction are in accordance
with accepted standards of practice for meet-
ing provisions of this subsection based on their
development and/or review of the structural
design, specifications and plans. Such certifi-
cations shall be provided to the official as set
forth in CHMC 15.11.030(C)(3)(c);

d. Nonresidential structures that are
elevated, not floodproofed, must meet the
same standards for space below the lowest
floor as described in subsection (B)(1)(b) of
this section.

Applicants who are floodproofing
nonresidential buildings should be notified
that flood insurance premiums will be based
on rates that are one foot below the flood-
proofed level (e.g., a building floodproofed to
the base flood level will be rated as one foot
below). Floodproofing the building an addi-
tional foot will reduce insurance premiums
significantly.

3. Manufactured Homes. All manufac-
tured homes in the floodplain to be placed or
substantially improved on sites shall be ele-
vated on a permanent foundation such that the
lowest floor of the manufactured home is ele-
vated one foot or more above the base flood
elevation and be securely anchored to an ade-
quately anchored foundation system to resist
flotation, collapse and lateral movement.

4. Recreational Vehicles. Recreational
vehicles placed on sites are required to either:

a. Be on the site for fewer than 180
consecutive days; or

b. Be fully licensed and ready for
highway use, on wheels or jacking system,
attached to the site only by quick disconnect
type utilities and security devices, and have no
permanently attached additions; or

c. Meet the requirements of subsec-
tion (B)(3) of this section and the elevation and



Clyde Hill Municipal Code

anchoring requirements for manufactured
homes.

C. AE and A1-30 Zones with Base Flood
Elevations but No Floodways. In areas with
base flood elevations (but a regulatory flood-
way has not been designated), no new con-
struction, substantial improvements, or other
development (including fill) shall be permitted
within Zones A1-30 and AE on the commu-
nity’s FIRM, unless it is demonstrated that the
cumulative effect of the proposed develop-
ment, when combined with all other existing
and anticipated development, will not increase
the water surface elevation of the base flood
more than one foot at any point within the
community.

D. Floodways. Located within areas of spe-
cial flood hazard established in CHMC
15.11.020(B) are areas designated as flood-
ways. Since the floodway is an extremely haz-
ardous area due to the velocity of floodwaters
that can carry debris and increase erosion
potential, the following provisions apply:

1. Prohibit encroachments, including
fill, new construction, substantial improve-
ments, and other development unless certifica-
tion by a registered professional engineer is
provided, demonstrating through hydrologic
and hydraulic analyses performed in accor-
dance with standard engineering practice that
the proposed encroachment would not result in
any increase in flood levels during the occur-
rence of the base flood discharge.

2. Construction or reconstruction of res-
idential structures is prohibited within desig-
nated floodways, except for (a) repairs,
reconstruction, or improvements to a structure
which do not increase the ground floor area;
and (b) repairs, reconstruction or improve-
ments to a structure, the cost of which does not
exceed 50 percent of the market value of the
structure either (i) before the repair, or recon-
struction is started, or (ii) if the structure has
been damaged, and is being restored, before
the damage occurred. Any project for
improvement of a structure to correct existing

15-20.7

15.11.040

violations of state or local health, sanitary, or
safety code specifications which have been
identified by the local code enforcement offi-
cial and which are the minimum necessary to
assure safe living conditions, or to structures
identified as historic places, may be excluded
in the 50 percent.

3. If subsection (D)(2) of this section is
satisfied, all new construction and substantial
improvements shall comply with all applicable
flood hazard reduction provisions of this sec-
tion. (Ord. 892 § 1, 2008; Ord. 891 § 1, 2008)

(Revised 5/09)



(Revised 5/09)

This page left intentionally blank.

15-20.8




ClydeHill Municipal Code

Chapter 15.12

INSTALLATION OF UNDERGROUND
UTILITIES-ELECTRICAL
CONSTRUCTION

Sections:

15.12.010 Required.
15.12.020 Permit.
15.12.030 Compliance.

15.12.010 Required.

All electrical and/or communication facili-
ties, including but not limited to wires or
cables, incidental to use and/or occupancy of
any area of real property within the city shall
be installed underground. (Ord. 200 § 1, 1966)

15.12.020 Permit.

Prior to commencement of any electrica
construction work within the city a permit
therefor must be obtained from the Depart-
ment of Labor and Industries of the state, Elec-
trical Division. (Ord. 200 § 3, 1966)

15.12.030 Compliance.

All electrical construction work hereafter
performed within the city shall be in accor-
dancewith the National Electrical Codeand all
applicable laws of the state. (Ord. 200 § 2,
1966)

15-21

15.13.010

Chapter 15.13
VIOLATION —PENALTY

Sections:
15.13.010 Violation — Penalty.

15.13.010 Violation — Penalty.

A. Crimina Penalties. Any person, firm or
corporation violating any of the provisions of
this title shall, upon conviction, be guilty of a
misdemeanor, and each such person, firm or
corporation shal be guilty of a separate
offense for each and every day or a portion
thereof during which any violation of any of
the provisions of this chapter is committed,
continued or permitted. Upon conviction of
such violation, such person, firm or corpora-
tion shall be punishable by a fine of not more
than $300.00, or by imprisonment for not more
than 90 days, or by both such fine and impris-
onment for each separate offense.

B. Civil Infraction. Any person, firm or
corporation who violatesany provisionsof this
title shall be subject, in addition to other penal-
ties hereunder, to a civil penalty of not more
than $250.00 per day or portion of a day for
each violation of thistitle, plus payment of the
city’ s reasonable attorneys’ fees, witness fees,
staff time and other costsincurred in enforcing
said civil penalty. Notices of violation shall be
issued by the building official. Any person
who recelves a notice of violation shall
respond within 15 days from the date the
notice is served. The date of serviceisthe date
the notice of violation is either (1) served on
the violator(s) personally, or by leaving acopy
of the notice at the house of theviolator’ susual
abode with some person of suitable age and
discretion then resident therein, (2) deposited
into the United States mail, postage prepaid,
viafirst class and certified mail, return receipt
requested, or (3) is otherwise received, which-
ever occurs first. Persons wishing to contest
the notice of violation and people who do not
wish to contest the notice of violation but wish
to explain mitigating circumstances, shall file



15.13.010

a request for a hearing within 15 days of the
date the notice of violation is served and, upon
the city’ s receipt of atimely request, a hearing
shall be scheduled as follows:

1. A noticeof violationissued for failure
to obtain a building permit without a prior
approved variance shall be scheduled before
the board of adjustment.

2. All other violations shall be sched-
uled before the mayor.

The determination by the mayor or board of
adjustment, as the case may be, shall be final,
binding and conclusive unlessajudicial appeal
is filed with the King County superior court
within 21 days of the date of issuance of the
written determination by the mayor or board of
adjustment. Failureto timely appeal the notice
of violation results in the notice becoming the
final binding order of the city.

C. In those instances where a civil penalty
has been imposed for failure to obtain a permit
required under this title, such permit shall not
be issued until such time as the civil penalty
has been paid and all other requirements have
been met. As a condition of the final determi-
nation of the amount of the civil penalty to be
Imposed, the building official, mayor or board
of adjustment, as the case may be, may require
abatement of any nonpermitted construction.

D. Abatement. The building official may
seek legal or equitable relief to enjoin any acts
or practices and abate any condition which
constitutesaviolation of CHMC Title 15 when
civil or criminal penalties are inadequate to
effect compliance. (Ord. 784 § 1, 1998; Ord.
781 81, 1998; Ord. 762 § 2, 1997; Ord. 662 §
2, 1992; Ord. 516, 1985)

15-22





